
Proposal from SEIU 521 to Kern County 

SEIU reserves the right to add, modify, and delete to the following proposal.  

 

ARTICLE V – CLASSIFICATION  

Section 7 – Classification Study  

Workers may request a classification study during the month of March, or such time as 
designated by the Director of Personnel, but in any event no less than one (1) month per 
calendar year. Requests shall be submitted to Human Resources on the authorized online 
request form.  

A Committee, made up of representatives from HR and the Union, will meet annually one 
(1) month after the close of the window, to determine which submitted requests will be 
accepted for study, which requests will be placed in a deferred status, and which requests 
will be denied. The Committee will base their consideration on a number of factors, which 
may include classification levels, recruitment or retention diƯiculties, fiscal impact, and 
new responsibilities assigned but not covered on existing job specifications. The 
Committee will finalize the list and the scope of each study (I.e. full classification study, job 
specification revision, salary review, etc.) within three (3) months after the first meeting. 
The maximum number of requests accepted by the committee for study shall be capped at 
12 per year, but upon completion of the accepted studies, HR may continue to work 
studies in the deferred status. Requests in the deferred status not initiated for study by HR 
before the next window may be considered by the committee without requiring a new 
request, however, an updated PCQ and job application may be requested.  

If the request is incomplete, HR will notify the worker to complete the request, along with a 
due date for completing the request.  

HR will notify workers of the status of their request (i.e. accepted, deferred, or denied) and 
the scope where appropriate.  

Workers who are under study shall not be permitted to submit a request. Workers whose 
classification study was denied shall not be permitted to request another classification 
study until one additional window has passed.  

If the study is denied, the worker may appeal to the Director of Personnel. The appeal shall 
be submitted in writing within ten (10) working days of the receipt of the denial. The 
Director of Personnel shall determine the procedure of the appeal. The Director shall 
provide the Union with the list of the appeal decisions.  



The Director will provide a list of accepted studies, including those accepted on appeal, 
and the expected completion date.  

If ESA-HR determines some assigned duties fall outside of the worker’s classification, ESA-
HR will notify the appointing authority to remove such duties within ten (10) working days of 
that determination.  

Any duties performed at a higher-level while receiving work-out-of-class pay will not be 
considered.  

 

If a study is accepted or approved on appeal, the completed study shall be posted to the 
Union no later than 12 months after the date of acceptance or favorable appeal 
determination, unless otherwise agreed to by both parties.  

If it is recommended that the worker be reclassified, all Merit System Rules that apply to 
regular classification studies, such as test requirements, meeting the employment 
standards, serving a new probation period, etc. shall apply. 


